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COVID-19 Safety Plan 
January 2022 

 
 

On January 7, 2022, the provincial health officer announced an order requiring employers to re-

activate their COVID-19 Safety Plans. This replaces the previous requirement for employers to 

have communicable disease prevention plans in their workplaces. While communicable disease 

prevention plans and COVID-19 Safety Plans share some of the same fundamental principles, 

COVID-19 Safety Plans are formal, written plans with more rigorous controls and are more 

appropriate for periods of elevated risk, such as the one currently faced by B.C. workplaces by 

the Omicron variant.  

This COVID-19 Safety Plan supplements Saanich’s Communicable Disease Prevention plan. 

 

Location: Cedar Hill Recreation Centre and Cedar Hill Golf Clubhouse 

Date: January 20, 2022 

Version: V3 

JHSC review date: January 25, 2022 

Electronic copy 
posted on Saanich 
website: 

https://www.saanich.ca/EN/main/parks-recreation-community/active-
living-guide/customer-support.html 

 

Physical copies 
posted (note 
locations): 

1. Posted publicly near front desk 
2. In staff room 
3. At front desk for inquiries/inspections 

Developed using: WorkSafeBC’s COVID-19 Safety Plan template (01/13/22) 

 

To assist each location in developing and updating their Safety Plans, this template has been 
created. The template captures work done by the organization as a whole.  
 
Considering PHO Orders specific to some Saanich locations and other supporting documents 
developed by departments, additional comments are added for each Saanich location.  
 
Safety Plans are to be reviewed by the Joint Health and Safety Committee for each location. 
Please note the date of the JHSC meeting at which the plan is to be or has been reviewed. 
 
At the time of creating this template, the PHO Order was not yet posted. Considering this is a 
reactivation of Safety Plans, Saanich believes there will be a requirement to have them posted 
in the workplace so that it is readily available for review by workers, other persons who may 
attend a workplace to provide services, and members of the public. 

 

 

http://elink/intranet/includes/secure_file.cfm?ID=458&menuID=5110
https://www.saanich.ca/EN/main/parks-recreation-community/active-living-guide/customer-support.html
https://www.saanich.ca/EN/main/parks-recreation-community/active-living-guide/customer-support.html
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Saanich has operated an Emergency Operations Centre (EOC) throughout the pandemic 
which has focused on ensuring health, safety and support of employees. Staff can provide 
input through their supervisor, their Joint Health and Safety Committee (JHSC) at their 
location and/or through a COVID-19 specific email address.  

Regular COVID-19 updates (including updates to policies, guides, safety plans, crew talks, 
mental health talks, safe work practices, procedures, decision trees, frequently asked 
questions and other resources) continue to be sent to all Saanich staff by the Chief 
Administrative Officer to ensure consistency of information sharing, and physical and 
psychological support for our employees. For those staff without email, printed copies have 
been posted and information has been shared at crew and safety meetings. 

Staff have been consulted in the development of many safe work practices and these 
practices are reviewed by the JHSCs.  

Common areas have been identified and occupancy signage has remain posted. Where 
possible, occupancy limits has been added to room booking systems.  

High touch surfaces were identified through our cleaning risk assessments and cleaning 
protocols were established. Cleaning regiments in other spaces follow industry established 
standards (e.g. BCRPA) and have been reviewed by Island Health’s Environmental Health 
Officers. 
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In response to COVID-19, Saanich continues to limit visitors in our facilities and some 
facilities such as Saanich Fire department remain closed to the public. Saanich residence and 
businesses are encouraged to use on-line services. Some services are offered only by 
appointment or with registration. 

Occupancy limits have been established in common areas throughout our Saanich facilities. 
Where applicable these have been set using industry standards such as BCRPA’s Guidelines 
for Restarting Operations and PHO Orders. 

Staff working in offices have access to the building prior to the start of their shift and many 
staff (both office and non-office) already have staggered start times (e.g. 7:30, 8:00 and 8:30 
am). Staff who primarily work outside, report to their respective shop and can report to 
outside areas as needed.  

In-person meetings have been eliminated as much as possible through the use of two-types 
of conference calling and virtual meetings using MS Teams. Some in-person meetings are 
still required and take place in large or open areas with sufficient physical distancing. Access 
to outdoor spaces and other shelters provides additional space for start and end of shift, meal 
breaks and meetings.  

Saanich created and has updated the COVID-19 Response – Work From Home Policy 

allowing some staff to work from home. Considering Saanich’s role to support the community, 
not all staff are able to work from home. 

To support physical distancing, floor markers and directional signage have been established 
and reviewed. Additionally, education and training related to Safe Manual Handling – While 
maintaining physical distancing has been provided. 
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For our indoor spaces, a Corporate standard for physical distancing in our inside 
environments was developed, and more than 400 workstations were assessed. Engineering 

controls including barriers were installed as needed and administrative controls were relied 
upon in some areas. 

Cleaning of barriers has been included in cleaning schedules. Additionally, non-WHMIS 
controlled disinfecting supplies have been provided to staff and a DIY Workstation 
Disinfecting safe work practices was created and communicated to all staff through CAO 

emails. 

 

Signage is posted throughout Saanich facilities. To enhance adherence to Saanich’s 
preventative measures, signage has been refreshed a number of times throughout the 
pandemic. 

Staff training and information sharing has been regular and ongoing through CAO emails, 
policies, guides, safety plans, crew talks, mental health talks, safe work practices, 
procedures, decision trees, frequently asked questions and other resources. For new staff or 
staff who have been away during the pandemic, a COVID-19 specific orientation has been 
developed. 
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Saanich created and has updated staff focused Use of mask frequently asked questions and 
Mask decision tree. All Saanich employees have been provided with adjustable 3-layer 
disposable masks.  

Saanich’s use of mask FAQs provides instruction on proper mask use including 
WorkSafeBC’s mask publications on selecting and using masks in non-health care settings, 
and how to use a mask, as well as BC Centre for Disease Controls’ Face masks: How are 
they different and Public Health Agency of Canada’s COVID-19: How to safely use a non-
medical mask or face covering. 

 

Cleaning risk assessments were conducted and Saanich identified and purchased Health 
Canada approved hard-surface disinfectants which in their diluted concentration are non- 
hazardous (non-WHMIS). As required, cleaning regiments have been reviewed by Island 
Health’s Environmental Health Officers.  

To supplement disinfecting and cleaning done by Building Service Workers and other staff, 
DIY Workstation Disinfecting and DIY Meeting Room Disinfecting safe work practices were 

created and communicated to all staff.  

Needs assessments for handwashing both inside buildings and in the field were conducted. 
Multiple means of in-field handwashing have been put in place. Additional hand washing 
locations have been identified during the colder weather. Health Canada approved hand 
sanitizer has also been provided in our buildings and for staff working in the field.  

Good hand hygiene and coughing/sneezing etiquette have been outlines in numerous CAO 
emails and information has been posted in the intranet. This information has been reiterated 
in Special Advisory crew talks and through signage.  

Two safe work practices were created relate to payment and document handling - 
Contactless Payment and Safe Cash Handling Procedures – COVID-19 Prevention and Safe 
Document Handling Procedures – COVID-19 Prevention. 

In some cases, furniture, tools and equipment have been simplified. In some cases, these 
items were maintained to limit staff leaving and returning to the building during the day. 
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Policy information have been shared with all staff through CAO emails or safety talks, and 
has been posted on the intranet. Additional guidance is shared in the COVID-19 
(Coronavirus) – HR Guide for Staff which is updated regularly. 

Saanich has established COVID-19 Vaccination Policy and COVID-19 Vaccination Policy – 
Volunteer and Contractors. 

Considering that COVID-19 is a communicable disease, workers who become sick during 
their day have been advised to report to first aid only if they require treatment; otherwise they 
have been advised to contact their your manager and then leave the workplace. This ensures 
first aid attendants continue to be available during the pandemic.  
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Additional information specific to this location: 

ADDENDUM to COVID-19 Safety Plan – Guidelines for Saanich Recreation 

Centres - January 20, 2022 V3  \\Fileserver2\recreation\Rec Share\Covid 19 - Rec 

Reopen planning\COVID-19 Safety Plan\Addendum C-19 Guidelines Recreation 

Centres Jan 2022.docx 

 

ADDENDUM to COVID-19 Safety Plan – Guidelines for Saanich Community 

Services - January 20, 2022 V3    G:\Community Services\COVID-19\2022 

Update\Addendum C-19 Guidelines Community Services Jan 2022.docx 

 

file://///Fileserver2/recreation/Rec%20Share/Covid%2019%20-%20Rec%20Reopen%20planning/COVID-19%20Safety%20Plan/Addendum%20C-19%20Guidelines%20Recreation%20Centres%20Jan%202022.docx
file://///Fileserver2/recreation/Rec%20Share/Covid%2019%20-%20Rec%20Reopen%20planning/COVID-19%20Safety%20Plan/Addendum%20C-19%20Guidelines%20Recreation%20Centres%20Jan%202022.docx
file://///Fileserver2/recreation/Rec%20Share/Covid%2019%20-%20Rec%20Reopen%20planning/COVID-19%20Safety%20Plan/Addendum%20C-19%20Guidelines%20Recreation%20Centres%20Jan%202022.docx
file://///FILESERVER2/RECREATION/Community%20Services/COVID-19/2022%20Update/Addendum%20C-19%20Guidelines%20Community%20Services%20Jan%202022.docx
file://///FILESERVER2/RECREATION/Community%20Services/COVID-19/2022%20Update/Addendum%20C-19%20Guidelines%20Community%20Services%20Jan%202022.docx

